
ing; a ban on the sale of tobacco in health 
care facilities, educational facilities, drug 
stores, and food stores; mandatory re­
quirements for self-extinguishing ciga­
rettes; a ban on the sale of cigarettes to 
minors; and more explicit health warn­
ings on all cigarette packages. Collabo­
ration with such groups as the Coalition 
on Smoking OR Health is suggested; this 
activity has also been provided for in the 
proposed budget. Nurses are also en­
couraged to participate in the develop­
ment and implementation of policies to 
assure smoke-free environments in 
public places, especially in health care 

facilities. 
The successful implementation of this 

ambitious plan for action depends upon 
the willingness of many nurses to commit 
time and resources to the suggested ac­
tivities. The formal resolutions of the 
ANA provide the impetus for collective 
and individual action on this critical 
health issue. 

Elizabeth Wilson, RN, EoD 

Ms Wilson is an assistant professor in 
the Division of Allied Health/Nursing 
at Bergen Community College, Para­
mus, NJ 07652. 

Two physicians provided major assis­
tance in promoting the proposed ANA 
resolutions among nurses. Leland Fair­
banks, MD, Indian Health Service, 
Phoenix, AZ helped to disseminate 
copies of the resolutions prior to the 
convention, and Paul Richburg, MD, 
Dallas, TX helped publicize the news of 
the adoption of the resolutions. 

At its October 1984 annual meeting the 
New York State Nurses' Association sup­
ported the ANA resolutions and banned 
smoking at all of its future business and 
program meetings. 

-Editor 

How tobacco companies have found religion 

In 1983 Philip Morris Inc, America's 
largest cigarette manufacturer, at­
tached itself to the prestige and influ­
ence of the Vatican. As principal spon­
sor of the first US tour of "The Vatican 
Collections: The Papacy and Art," the 
New York-based tobacco company was 
able to attain a close association in the 
public eye with major religious and cul­
tural organizations. The year-long ex­
hibition was seen by two million people 
at the Metropolitan Museum of Art in 
New York, the Art Institute of Chica­
go, and the MH de Young Memorial 
Museum in San Francisco. Along with 
prominent news coverage and feature 
articles, numerous advertisements for 
the exhibition appeared in the editorial 
and arts pages of The New York Times, 
The Los Angeles Times, Chicago Sun­
Times, Chicago Tribune, and other 
newspapers-paid for by Philip Morris 
(Fig I). Each advertisement listed the 
brands of cigarettes manufactured by 
the company. For its $3 million spon­
sorship-a fraction of the company's 
annual cigarette advertising budget in 
excess of $500 million-Philip Morris 
reaped enormous favorable exposure in 
the mass media, including photographs 
of cigarette company executives along­
side church dignitaries, museum offi­
cials, patrons of the arts, politicians, 
and even the First Lady. 

In 1984 Philip Morris sponsored the 
national tour of "The Precious Lega­
cy," which displayed Jewish artwork 
confiscated from individuals killed in 

the Nazi holocaust (Fig 2). The tobac­
co-subsidized exhibition broke atten­
dance records at the San Diego Muse­
um of Art and other stops on its tour. 

HEAR No Ev1L ... 
The acceptance by Catholic, Jewish, 

FIGURE 1. Advertisements for Philip Morris­
sponsored Vatican art tour appeared in The 
New York Times, The Washington Post and oth­
er newspapers and newsmagazines. Names of 
the company's cigarette brands are listed at the 
bottom of this ad. The Surgeon General's warn­
ing does not appear. 

and other religious groups of donations 
from cigarette manufacturers has in­
creased in recent years. The morality of 
this relationship has gone virtually un­
questioned in religious circles and in the 
mass media. One cleric who had forgot­
ten the Philip Morris connection is Fa­
ther Robert Drinan, a professor of law 
at Georgetown University who intro­
duced several antismoking measures 
while serving in the US House of Re­
presentatives in the 1970s. "I thought 
religions were supposed to be against 
smoking," he told the Journal. 

One of the few journalists who have 
questioned the ethics of the acceptance 
by religious and cultural institutions of 
tobacco company gifts is Roy Larson, 
former religion editor of the Chicago 
Sun-Times. Following the announce­
ment of the sponsorship of the Vatican 
art exhibition, Larson charged in his 
column (Chicago Sun-Times, Nov 27, 
1982: 18) that the Art Institute of Chi­
cago would become "a crude outpost in 
Marlboro Country. For centuries," 
wrote Larson, "the Roman Catholic 
Church has been in the business of 
forming opinions. Generally, it has tak­
en a 'pro-life' stance. Witness its cur­
rent campaigns against abortion and 
nuclear war. That's what makes the 
Vatican look so inconsistent when it 
lends its vast prestige to the-Philip Mor­
ris firm, whose president in 1971 stated 
its rationale for gifts to the arts by say­
ing, 'It's a lot cheaper than taking 
out ads saying how great we think we 
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Precious. Legacy. 

FIGURE 2. Advertisement in Newsweek for Philip Morris-sponsored Judaica art tour. 

are.'" 
Larson told the Journal there was al­

most no reaction to his column, "except 
one guy almost attacked me at a cock­
tail party," and one letter to the editor, 
from a nurse, was published in support 
of Larson. No religious authority chal­
lenged or commended him: "Catholic 
officialdom was silent," he said. 

When the Vatican exhibition opened, 
The New York Times ran a short article 
(New York Times Feb 28, 1983:34) un­
der the headline "A ceremonial picket­
ing," about a group of 35 physicians, 

medical students, and parents protest­
ing tobacco company sponsorship of the 
Vatican exhibition outside the Metro­
politan Museum of Art (Fig 3). The ar­
ticle referred to Monsignor Eugene V. 
Clark, a former New York Archdiocese 
spokesman who represented the Vati­
can Museum in negotiations. "The 
sponsor is not Philip Morris as a ciga­
rette company but Philip Morris Inc'' 
Clark told The Times. Philip Morris 
l.nc manufactures a handful of non-to­
bacco products, among them Miller 
Beer and 7-Up, but more than 90% of 
its income is derived from its 170 
brands of cigarettes. 

TESTIMONIALS 

A less-publicized facet of prominent 
religious organizations is revealed in 
the bi-monthly issues of the United 
States Tobacco and Candy Journal, a 
New York-based trade publication for 
tobacco distributors. The National 
Conference of Christians and Jews 
(NCCJ), Catholic Charities, the Anti­
Defamation League of B'nai B'rith 
(ADL), the United Jewish Appeal/ 
Federation of Jewish Philanthropies, 
and the American Jewish Committee 
have all hosted dinners in recent years 
honoring tobacco company executives. 
Full-page advertisements announcing 
these activities are published in the US 
Tobacco and Candy Journal (Fig 4). 
The following events were among those 
held in 1984: 

• The Tobacco, Candy and Allied Trades 
Division of the NCCJ honored James 
C. Bowling, senior vice president of 
Philip Morris Incorporated, at a $250-
a-plate dinner June 5, at the New York 
Hilton. Senator Wendell Ford of Ken­
tucky made the presentation of the or­
ganization's annual brotherhood 
award. 

• The Man of the Year Award of the 
Anti-Defamation League of B'nai 
B'rith for 1984 went to Leon Shahun, 
Jr, president of the National Associ­
ation of Tobacco Distributors. Shahun 
was honored for his "deep, abiding be­
lief in social commitment and social 
service," at the St. Regis Hotel, New 
York City, September 18, at a $250-a­
plate dinner. 

• On December 11 at the Waldorf As­
toria Hotel, the American Jewish Com­
mittee gave Hugh Cullman, retired 

The Ant1•Defamat1'-,n ltague of B'n,u B'rith 

announce~ with great pride the 
pre~entat1on [){ its 1985 
Americani1>rn AwarJ 

HORACER.KORNEGAY 
Chairman, T'·accnli,,rnu«, In, 

at a dinner in his honor 
at rhe Wa~htngt"n Hiiton 

W.i5hmgton, DC 

Senawr Sam ). Ervm, Jr Senator Earle C Clements 
\\c,,s,,. .. C .\),"'""" 

MAY 9, 1985 
FIGURE 3. "Housecall" paid by physicians, 
medical students, and New Jersey GASP (Group 
Against Smoking Pollution) on Metropolitan Mu­
seum of Art, New York City to protest tobacco 
company sponsorship of the arts. 

FIGURE 4. Advertisements in United States Tobacco and Candy Journal announcing awards by 

religious organizations to tobacco industry executives. 
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chairman of the board of Philip Morris 
its Human Relations Award. (A simi­
lar dinner was held in November 1981 
to honor Edward A. Horrigan, presi­
dent of RJ Reynolds.) 

Why would any religious organiza­
tion choose to honor an executive of a 
cigarette company? "You're asking a 
rather touchy question that's not fair to 
ask of the American Jewish Council," 
said Seymour Rich, who was coordina­
tor for one of the testimonial dinners for 
a tobacco company executive. "We're 
honoring people who are very interested 
in the AJC, and we honor someone 
from the tobacco industry every year." 

Like its counterpart organizations, 
the AJC honors executives from several 
fields that donate money to the commit­
tee, such as the supermarket and bank­
ing fields. Rich could not name a board 
of the AJC that examines ethics in 
fund-raising. "If it was a clear-cut deci­
sion about the tobacco industry, I as­
sume the government would make it il­
legal," Rich told the Journal. The AOL 
spokesman, informed of the questions 
the Journal intended to pose, did not 
comment. 

Father Joseph Funaro of the Catho­
lic Diocese of Brooklyn has accepted 
funds for Catholic Charities at tobacco 
industry dinners in Chicago and Dallas 
and has entertained audiences at these 
functions with his singing rendition of 
"If I Were a Rich Man" from "Fiddler 
on the Roof." Funaro told the Journal 
he "didn't think about [the issue of] 
smoking" at the dinners. "You 're see­
ing something dangerous in accepting 
money. I see the individuals I can help," 
said Funaro. "You're involved in the 
cigarette, and I'm involved with the 
person. I never received money with 
cigarette ashes on it." After discussing 
the health hazards of smoking and oth­
er lifestyles, Funaro said, "I never 
thought about not accepting the money 
because it came from cigarettes, but 
maybe I should have." 

Harry Robinson, director of public 
relations for the National Council of 
Christians and Jews, said the NCCJ 
definitely has ethical considerations in 
accepting money. "We honor people 
who have made a contribution in their 
civic duty," said Robinson, "not what 
they do businesswise or how they earn 
their living. The Surgeon General has 
warned people that smoking is danger­
ous to their health, but it's not illegal." 
Robinson said people crusading against 
the cigarette industry "have forgotten 
that tobacco is indigenous to the econo­
my of our country." He said that Sena-

tor Jesse Helms won re-election in 
North Carolina for his pro-tobacco 
stand. "If you really want to find out, go 
down and talk to these evangelical to­
bacco-growing folks who seem to be so 
religiously fervent, and see what they 
say about tobacco," said Robinson. 

SOUTHERN CHURCHES SPEAK OUT 

Indeed, in North Carolina it is not 
easy to bring up the moral implications 
of profiting from tobacco, as the North 
Carolina Council of Churches has dis­
covered. The state grows 42% of the to­
bacco produced in the United States, 
and I 50,000 jobs ( or 7% of the state's 
workforce) are tied to the tobacco in­
dustry, according to the North Caroli­
na Department of Agriculture ( Wall St 
Journal, May 8, 1984:37). In 1983, the 
29-denomination council, following up 
on an inquiry by a local United Meth­
odist Church into the problem of world 
hunger, began to discuss the moral di­
lemma of growing tobacco instead of 
food in a time of widespread starvation 
(New York Times, Dec 4, 1983:44). 
The council formed a Tobacco Study 
Committee which issued a report rec­
ommending that the state's tobacco 
farmers switch to other crops for moral 
reasons. 

This conclusion incurred the wrath of 

tobacco farmers, marketers and manu­
facturers, who pointed out that tobacco 
contributes $1 billion a year to the 
state's economy. Concern was ex­
pressed by the Tobacco Growers' Infor­
mation Committee that the council's 
report would be "used in propaganda 
wars by our enemies" (Los Angeles 
Times, Apr 27, 1984:1, 15-16). The 
managing director of the growers' com­
mittee noted that rural Methodist 
churches and all retired United Meth­
odist ministers in North Carolina re­
ceive financial support from the Duke 
Endowment, which was established by 
tobacco baron James Buck Duke ( Wall 
St Journal, May 8, 1984:37). 

(Although Southern Baptists, the 
largest single denomination, are not re­
presented on the council, the North 
Carolina Baptist Convention has not 
been silent on the subject of smoking. In 
I 982, the convention supported a US 
House Resolution calling for a ban on 
cigarette smoking on airliners [Atlanta, 
Constitution, Apr 5, 1984:1, 8]). 

In 1984 at its annual meeting, the 
Southern Baptist Convention (the na­
tion's largest Protestant denomination 
with 14 million members in 36,000 con­
gregations) drafted a resolution that 
urged Baptists engaged in growing to­
bacco to switch to other crops. It called 
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FIGURE 5. Hadassah Magazine publishes articles on health care and medical research alongside 
cigarette advertisements. 

on Congress to end tobacco subsidies, 
asked parents (and all Baptists) not to 
smoke, and urged schools and churches 
to step up their dissemination of infor­
mation on the harmfulness of smoking. 

It is significant that churches in to­
bacco-growing states have expressed a 
stronger anti-tobacco sentiment than 
other American religious denomina­
tions apart from Seventh Day Adven­
tist, Jehovah's Witness, Mormon, Pen­
tecostal, Muslim, and other groups that 
advocate abstention from the use of to­
bacco. 

SILENT RELIGIOUS PRESS 

Are the silence or complacency of 
other religious organizations on the 
subject of smoking and the 360,000 
cigarette-related deaths in the US each 
year tied to the acceptance of money 
from tobacco companies? The evidence 
suggests this. In addition to holding tes­
timonial dinners for tobacco executives 
and welcoming tobacco sponsorship of 
religio-cultural events, certain religious 
newspapers-the editorial voices of 
various denominations-accept ciga­
rette advertisements. 

dassah-Hebrew University Medical 
Center in Jerusalem. Each issue of Ha­
dassah Magazine has three to five full­
page cigarette advertisements, usually 
for brands made by RJ Reynolds and 
Loews (Fig 5). These are often juxta­
posed to articles describing medical ad­
vances in the diagnosis and treatment 
of cancer and other diseases. 

Hadassah member Bernice Kleiman, 
who is married to a San Diego neurolo­
gist, was among the first persons to call 
attention to this "ridiculous and dis­
gusting" situation. "I have belonged to 
Hadassah for many years," she told the 

l 
I 

Great taste 

Journal, "but I am absolutely appalled 
by the cigarette ads. In 1977 I wrote to 
the organization of my dismay and ex­
pressed my hope that once the contra­
diction of accepting cigarette advertis­
ing money on the one hand and financ­
ing medical research on the other was 
pointed out to them, they would termi­
nate these shameful advertisements. 
The president answered with this in­
credibly poor excuse: 'You should know 
that Hadassah opposes boycotts in prin­
ciple and therefore does not sponsor 
them. This policy holds even in this case 
where we recognize the adverse effects 
of tobacco advertising.' Talk about hy­
pocrisy." 

Alan Tigay, editor of Hadassah 
Magazine, told the Journal that the 
magazine accepts cigarette advertise­
ments because it is "an economic neces­
sity. We do get one or two complaints a 
month about it," he said. "Our response 
is that the ads follow the dictates of the 
Surgeon General's office, and that it's 
an important source of revenue without 
which it's possible this magazine 
couldn't survive." The editor said that 
some groups of readers object to liquor 
advertising too, and "if we give in to on~ 
segment of readership, we'd have to 
give in to all." The policy of the maga­
zine will continue, he said, "unless the 
people who say there are surely other 
sources of revenue, can show them to 
me." 

But Herb Brin, editor of the Jewish 
weekly Heritage newspaper, with four 
editions in California, has always main­
tained a policy against cigarette adver­
tising, "since 1941 when I read the first 

Stony Brook: "We were scared lo deal with S,1ud1s," p l 

Consider the example of Hadassah 
Magazine, the official monthly publi­
cation of Hadassah, the 375,000-mem­
ber Women's Zionist Organization of 
America. The major activity of the or­
ganization, founded in 1912, is fund­
raising for medical research and health 
care in Israel. In 1981 nearly half of the 
$37 million raised by the organization 
was given to the 4,000-employee Ha- FIGURE 6. Front and back covers of a Jewish weekly newspaper covering Long Island, NY. 
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press release about experiments saying 
it might be harmful." Brin said smok­
ing means destruction of the body, 
therefore it is a sin. Not accepting the 
ads hurts financially, he told the Jour­
nal. "And because 20% of out readers 
are college students, the cigarette com­
panies would love to have us. But they 
never will." 

The relatively large number of Jew­
ish physicians and the value placed on 
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health by the Jewish community would 
logically lead one to conclude that pub­
lishing of advertisements promoting 
cigarettes in Hadassah Magazine and 
numerous other Jewish newspapers 
(Fig 6) would be nothing short of scan­
dalous. Instead, the virtual absence of 
protests suggests that this setting repre­
sents an ideal opportunity for tobacco 
companies to foster complacency, or 
even a positive image, about smoking. 

("If Hadassah accepts it, then smoking 
can't really be that bad.") 

In spite of the sponsorship by Philip 
Morris of the Vatican art exhibition 
and in spite of the acceptance by Catho­
lic Charities of tobacco money, the 
Catholic press does not accept cigarette 
advertising. The weekly newspaper 
New York Catholic has long refused 
such advertisements because, accord­
ing to sales representative Charles 
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Murray, they are "not conducive to 
good health." Chicago Catholic busi­
ness manager Mary Healey told the 
Journal that cigarette advertisin? 
"doesn't seem to be congruent with the 
general ambiance of our newspaper." 

One Catholic theologian who isn't 
content to let tobacco companies-and 
their shareholders- escape responsi­
bility for their actions is Father Mi­
chael Crosby. Writing in the magazine 
Christianity and Crisis (May 30, 
1983:212-215) Crosby accuses tobacco 
companies of extreme unethical conduct 
in their failure to include warnings on the 
health risks of smoking in their increas­
ingly aggressive advertising campaigns 
in developing nations. Crosby believes 
stockholders should play a greater role 
in influencing corporate decisions. 
Crosby's religious body, the Midwest 
Province of the Capuchin Franciscan 
order, invests in stocks as a way to earn 
income for its work among the poor. But 
the order also uses the leverage of stock 
ownership to question the morality of 
company policies. With its 10 shares 

each in Philip Morris and RJ Reynolds, 
the order has sought through shareholder 
resolutions a review of their cigarette 
marketing practices in the Third World. 
In 1982 resolutions to this effect were 
vigorously opposed by management and 
were defeated by 98% (Philip Morris) 
and 96% (RJ Reynolds) of the vote. 
Crosby noted that the top five American 
insurance companies (Prudential, Met­
ropolitan, Equitable, Aetna, and John 
Hancock) each holds thousands of shares 
of both tobacco companies and did not 
support the resolutions. 

"At this point," concludes Crosby, 
"any shareholder protesting export 
policies of tobacco companies will be 
even more the voice of one crying in the 
wilderness than is the case with share­
holder protests against policies of arms 
manufacturers or the makers of infant 
formula." All the more reason, he sug­
gests, to maintain a constant presence 
within tobacco companies and to step 
up the challenges. In the short term, he 
says, "We expect to lose-but not to 
quit." 

Some religious groups have begun to 
re-examine their investment portfolios 
for possible financial links to cigarette 
companies and other manufacturers of 
harmful products. (In January 1985, 
when the British Medical Association, 
in conjunction with Social Audit, an in­
vestigative journalists' group, released 
a comprehensive list of religious and 
medical organizations that owned 
shares in tobacco companies, there was 
a great hue and cry-followed by a 
massive sell-off.) A long-time propo­
nent of "social investing"-the pur­
chase of stock in companies whose pro­
ducts and services, employment prac­
tices, and public policies meet a certain 
moral standard-is the Interfaith Cen­
ter on Corporate Responsibility (475 
Riverside Drive, New York, NY 
10115), a group affiliated with the Na­
tional Council of Churches. In addition 
to proposing stockholder resolutions on 
such issues as apartheid, military pro­
duction, and pharmaceutical marketing 
practices abroad, the center represents 
$10 billion in investments by 17 Protes­
tant agencies and 200 Roman Catholic 
orders and dioceses. 

The center's director, the Reverend 
Tim Smith, is dismayed by the increas­
ing ties of cigarette companies to reli­
gious organizations. "They are pushing 
a series of lies to gain approval in soci­
ety, in spite of what they provide and 
sell," Smith told the Journal. "It is the 
height of irony that the Vatican's reli­
gious art was sponsored by Philip Mor­
ris, who through advertising and pro­
motion is one of the greatest contribu­
tors to the death and deterioration of 
millions of people." 

Alan Blum, MD, 
Kathleen Fitzgerald 

Ms Fitzgerald is a freelance journalist 
in Chicago and a former reporter for The 
San Diego Tribune. 

IN-THE-STREETS PREVENTION 

An example of what may have been the first series of paid counteradver­
tisements in the United States aimed at undermining tobacco propaganda. 
From 1977 to 1979 bus bench ads such as this appeared throughout Mi­
ami, Florida. They were purchased by DOC (Doctors Ought to Care, Floyd 
Medical Center, Rome, GA 30161) after billboard companies refused to 
sell space to the physicians group. The low cost notwithstanding (less 
than $25 per month per bench), these ads, aimed at young people, 
sparked national publicity and led to the formation of other DOC groups. 
The absence of mass media counteradvertising in a community or society 
enables the tobacco industry to control the imagery, vocabulary, social 
acceptability, and flow of information in regard to cigarette smoking. 
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